
BID TABULATION
Custodial Supplies 6/4/2012

BIDDER

Single Fold
Towels     

(9.25" x 9.25" 
Min.)

Multi Fold
Towels     

(9.25" x 9.25" 
Min.)

Toilet Paper 
2ply 500 sheet 

(4.25" wide 
Min.)

TRASH BAGS 
33" X 39"      (1.0 

Mill Min.)

TRASH BAGS 
38" X 58"       

(1.5 Mill Min.)

NON-LATEX 
EXAM GLOVES  

SMALL

NON-LATEX  
EXAM GLOVES 

MEDIUM

NON-LATEX 
EXAM GLOVES 

LARGE

NON-LATES 
EXAM GLOVES       

X LARGE
EXAM TABLE 

PAPER 21 INCH

UNIT
(4000 case) (4000 case) (96 roll case)

(master case of 
250)

(master case of 
100)

(10 -100 count 
master case)

(10 -100 count 
master case)

(10 -100 count 
master case)

(10 -100 count 
master case) (12 roll case)

BID QUANTITIES          

All American Poly NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.47 $16.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Augusta Janitorial Supplies NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Central Poly Corp. $16.30 $16.90 $34.60 $19.40 $15.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Forms & Supply, Inc. $19.73 $14.27 $28.89 $24.47 $21.42 $51.80 $51.80 $51.80 $77.80 $41.89

Genesis II, Inc. $16.20 $14.89 $29.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.39 $42.39 NO BID NO BID

Interboro Packaging Corp.(need clarification) NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.48 $21.98 NO BID $36.00 $36.00 NO BID NO BID

Office Church School Supply Co. INC $25.70 $24.70 $56.58 $26.10 $22.45 $51.00 $51.00  NO BID

Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  $39.80 $39.80  NO BID

Quill INC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Smith & Jones Dist Co. INC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Snead Paper Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Southeastern Paper Corp $17.17 $14.64 $27.00 $12.48 $21.82  $37.78 $37.78  NO BID

Standard Stationery Supply Co NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Staples Advantage NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Supreme Medical $20.37 $19.29 $35.72 $33.18 $29.55 $34.39 $34.39 NO BID

Todd Distributors, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unipak NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.88 $15.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Western Carolina Products $15.49 $14.73 $24.59 $10.74 $17.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Xpedx (bid after deadline         

(Adj.) = Adjustments for case quantities from RFP and pallet charges
* = Vendor not able to deliver per schedule.

Low Responsible Bid
Alternate Product
Bid Calculation Adjustment Required


