
BID TABULATION
Instructional Supplies   6/4/2012

BIDDER
COPY PAPER 8 

1/2 x 11 DP
(REAMS)

PAPER BRAND
COPY PAPER 8 

1/2 x 14 DP
(REAMS)

Standard 
Pencil 

Sharpener       
(EACH)

Adjustable
Pencil 

Sharpener
(EACH)

White Board
Erasers
(EACH)

White Board
Markers
(4 PACK)

GRADE/LESSON 
PLAN COMBO 

(EACH)

BID QUANTITY       

Business Stationers NO BID  NO BID NO BID $6.52 $1.18 $1.79 NO BID

Contract Paper Group, Inc. $2.537 Fascopy $3.746 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Forms & Supply, Inc. $3.125 Smart Choice APD8511 $4.360 $8.34 $7.74 $2.40 $3.17 $5.54

Liberty Paper $2.588 Excellent Copy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 

National Art & School Supplies NO BID NO BID $9.00 $7.67 $2.29 $2.27 NO BID

Office Church School Supply Co. $3.250 Hammermill $5.500 $15.00 $13.10 $3.15 $3.30 $6.30

Pyramid School Products NO BID NO BID $7.44 $6.74 $2.35 $2.49 $5.19

School Tools NO BID NO BID $11.60 $11.60 $2.43 $4.22 $4.07

Standard Stationery NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Todd Distributors, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 

       

       

G Samuel Jone 6/11/2012
Kay Lewis 6/4/2012

Low Responsible Bid
Alternate Product
Bid Calculation Adjustment Required


